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oe: oeferral fees, referral arrangements and fee sharing: aiscussion document on the regulatory 
treatment of referral fees, referral arrangements and fee sharing 
 
qhe City of iondon iaw pociety E“Ciip”F represents approximately N4IMMM City lawyers through 
individual and corporate membership including some of the largest international law firms in the worldK  
qhese law firms advise a variety of clients from multinational companies and financial institutions to 
dovernment departmentsI often in relation to complexI multi jurisdictional legal issuesK   
 
qhe Ciip responds to a variety of consultations on issues of importance to its members through its NT 
specialist committeesK  qhis response in respect of the ipB consultation on “oeferral feesI referral 
arrangements and fee sharing” has been prepared by the Ciip mrofessional oules and oegulation 
Committee Ethe “moCoC”FK  qhe moCoC is made up of a number of solicitors from thirteen City of iondon 
firms who have specialist experience in the area of the regulation of the professionK 
 
fn cebruary this yearI we responded to the iegal pervices Consumer manel fnvestigation into oeferral 
ArrangementsK fn that responseI we did not comment on the question of the payment of referral fees in 
personal injury or other cases or matters for private individualsI as this is not the type of work in which our 
members are predominantly involvedK 
 
oeferral arrangements 
 
te did point outI howeverI that our member firms will regularly be referring business toI and receiving 
referrals of business fromI lawyers and other professionals such as accountantsK qhese referrals are 
commonplace and arise for a number of reasons includingI for exampleI conflictsI a lack of the requisite 
expertise within a firm EeKgK divorce or family mattersF or jurisdictional mattersK joreoverI as part of 
networking and business development activitiesI partners and lawyers in our member firms may have 
looseI informal understandings andLor arrangements with intermediaries such as investment banksI 
brokers and accountants for the mutual referral of opportunitiesI which may or may not result in legal 
workK 
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puch referrals are not characterised by payment in return for referral of businessK kor do they involve 
other nonJmonetary arrangements linked to the introduction of clientsI such as the provision of free or 
belowJcost services in exchange for the referral of other businessK diven the fluidity of these 
arrangements and the absence of any payment of referral fees or other monetary benefit to the referrerI 
we think that they should be expressly outwith the proposed disclosure regime for referral arrangementsK 
 
Consultancies 
 
peparatelyI our member firms may have consultancy arrangements with lawyersI which may include 
provisions for payment to the consultant on the introduction of workK qypicallyI these are oneJoff 
arrangements with individuals who are otherwise practising on their own accountK rnder the policitors 
Code at presentI referrals between lawyers Eas defined in the CodeF are excepted from the regulatory 
requirements of oule V of the CodeK   qhe overseas aspects are also potentially relevantK  fn some 
instancesI the lawyer may well be in an overseas jurisdiction and operating through a one man company 
so the referrer is strictly a nonJlawyer companyI though in substance it is the lawyer making the referral 
as part of a regulated legal practiceI so it would be appropriate for it to be treated as suchK  fn some 
overseas jurisdictions referral fees with lawyers or nonJlawyers are normal and a requirement to disclose 
arrangements which are otherwise entirely lawfulI over an above the normal duty of disclosure owed to 
clientsI puts us at a disadvantage to competitors from other countriesK  
 
thile we can see no objection in principle to the disclosure to a client on the inception of a matter that 
such a consultant may receive a fee in relation to the work in questionI we doubt that there is any client 
benefit in the publication by the approved regulator of the consultancy agreement in its entirety as 
proposed in oecommendation qwo in Chapter T Eoecommendations for improving transparency and 
disclosureFK 
 
Bulk-buyingLcentral procurement 
 
qhere are other referralJtype arrangements which we believe should be expressly excluded from the 
disclosure requirementsK qhese include where a framework agreement facilitating the callJoff of legal 
services by participants on agreed terms is in placeK qhese arrangements may involve the payment of a 
fee by the legal provider to the party which has put in place the frameworkK Bulk or centralJbuying 
arrangements also exist for the callJoff by purchasers of legal servicesI where a rebate may be due to the 
centralJbuying agencyI calculated by reference to the volume of business deliveredK eereI the individual 
purchasers of legal services will already be aware that they are purchasing pursuant to the centralJbuying 
arrangementsK  By way of example this arrangement is operatedI at clientsD insistenceI for certain work 
for the rh government where one department is the coordinator for procurement of legal services and 
receives a fee in respect of all work done for various government departments under the 
arrangementK  te can see no client benefit in the publication of the agreements in questionI and indeed 
the clientEsF may object to our doing soK 
 
vours sincerely  
 
 
aavid jcfntosh 
Chair 
Ciip 
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